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*To hear this message again or others from Eastridge Church, 

find them at www.eastridgechurch.org/grow/sermons. www.eastr idgechurch.org  

women’s bunco night  

Bunco is tomorrow night, Monday, July 18th at 6:30p.  The fee is $4 to 
cover the cost of prizes and the entrée.  If the fee is not in your budget 
please still come and join us; you are welcome and God has it covered.  If 
your last name begins with A-L please bring a salad or side dish; last 
name M-Z please bring a dessert.  Beverages will be provided.  Sign up at 
the info table! 

men’s ministry BBQ  

Join the men’s ministry for a BBQ and fellowship on July 26th at 6p. Men 
bring your kids & grandkids for pool time, food, and fun!  BBQ will be at 
the home of Ken Maes. Sign up at the info table for more details! 

kid’s club registration 

Time is running out!! Register for Kid’s Club if you have not yet done so! 
This year’s theme is “Cave Quest:  Following Jesus the Light of the 
World.” Kid’s Club will run August 1-5 from 9a to 12p each day.  We’re 
still in need of 2-3 crew leaders.  If you’re interested, sign up at the info 
table! 

youth mission trip benefit concert 

On Friday, July 22nd at 7p, Ben Tissell will be playing a benefit concert 
with all proceeds going toward the Alaska Mission Trip Fund.  Join us for 
live music, refreshments, and a general grand ole time together in our 
main auditorium!  Donations taken at the door. 

sweet offerings baking ministry 

Sweet offerings will be back next Sunday, July 24th.  The sweets will be 
available between first and second services.  This ministry is intended to 
be a fund-raising opportunity for the women’s minisitry; with no pressure 
to donate.  The sweet offerings team looks forward to providing you the 
sweets next week! Psalm 34:8-oh taste and see that the Lord is good. 

women’s retreat fall 2016 

This fall we will be having a women’s retreat themed “Radiance.:  arise, 
shine, for your light has come.”  This retreat will take place September 
23-25 at the Cascades Camp & Conference Center in Yelm, WA.  If 
you’re interested in more information, being on the committee for this 
event, or signing up for this retreat, visit the info table for a brochure and 
sign up!  The early bird registration discount of $25 will end July 10th. 

*To register online for this event visit: www.2016fallretreat.eventzilla.net 
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